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FOR IMMEDIATE RELEASE 

WaterStone Bank to Temporarily Close Lobby Access in all Branches  

Wauwatosa, Wis. – 3/16/2020 – WaterStone Bank announced today that it will temporarily 
close lobby access in all of its 13 branches starting Wednesday, March 18, 2020 until further 
notice in order to support efforts to help prevent the spread of coronavirus (COVID-19). 

“We are closing branch lobbies since the health and welfare of our employees and customers is 
paramount,” said WaterStone Bank’s President/CEO Doug Gordon. “We will remain fully 
staffed to continue to provide exceptional remote service to all our customers.” 

Drive-ups at all 13 WaterStone Bank branches will remain open for customers during normal 
business hours. ATMs and night deposit boxes are fully accessible 24 hours a day. To limit 
public exposure, WaterStone Bank encourages its customers to use its online, mobile and 
telephone banking services. WaterStone Bank’s Customer Service Center (414-761-1000) will 
be supported with additional staff to accommodate for the increased phone calls during this time.  

WaterStone Bank staff are continuing to allocate more time each day to clean facilities. This 
includes frequently sanitizing all highly active touch point areas at its branches such as ATMs, 
drive-up tube canisters and night depositories. WaterStone Bank has also taken the necessary 
internal measures to ensure all employees’ health is at the forefront while the bank remains open. 

For further information regarding WaterStone Bank’s regular business hours and online, mobile 
and telephone banking services, please visit wsbonline.com. WaterStone Bank will continue to 
provide updates regarding any changes to branch access on its website and social media 
accounts.  

About WaterStone Bank 
WaterStone Bank, established in 1921, offers a full suite of personal and business banking 
products. The community bank has branches in Wauwatosa/State St, Brookfield, Fox 
Point/North Shore, Franklin/Hales Corners, Germantown/Menomonee Falls, Greenfield/Loomis 
Rd, Oak Creek/27th St, Oak Creek/Howell Ave, Oconomowoc/Lake Country, Pewaukee, 
Waukesha, West Allis/Greenfield Ave, West Allis/National Ave, Wisconsin along with a 
commercial lending branch in Minneapolis, Minnesota. WaterStone Bank is the parent company 
to Waterstone Mortgage, which has the ability to lend in 48 states. For more information about 
WaterStone Bank, go to http://www.wsbonline.com. Follow WaterStone Bank on Facebook, 
Twitter, LinkedIn, YouTube, and Instagram. 
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